
	 	

	 	 	 	
	

	 	 	
	

	
	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	

	

    
  

   
  

 

  
   

        
    

       

    

 

     

               
                

                
 

       

                

         

                  

                  

                   

      

  

   

Application: John W. Lavelle Preparatory
Charter School 
Dana Volini -
Annual Reports 

Summary 

ID: 0000000081 
Status: Liaison Review 
Last submitted: Dec 1 2020 10:48 AM (EST) 
Labels: Board of Regents 

Entry 1 School Info and Cover Page 

Completed Jul 21 2020 

Instructions 

Required of ALL Charter Schools 

Each Annual Report begins with a completed School Information and Cover Page. The information is 
collected in a survey format within Annual Report portal. When entering information in the portal, some 
of the following items may not appear, depending on your authorizer and/or your responses to related 
items. 

Entry 1 School Information and Cover Page 

(New schools that were not open for instruction for the 2019-20 school year are not required 

to complete or submit an annual report this year). 

Please be advised that you will need to complete this cover page (including signatures) before all of the 

other tasks assigned to you by your school's authorizer are visible on your task page. While completing this 

cover page task, please ensure that you select the correct authorizer (as of June 30, 2020) or you may 

not be assigned the correct tasks. 

BASIC INFORMATION 
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a. SCHOOL NAME 

(Select name from the drop down menu) 

JOHN W LAVELLE PREPARATORY CHARTER SCHOOL 353100860959 

a1. Popular School Name 

Lavelle Prep 

b. CHARTER AUTHORIZER (As of June 30th, 2020) 

Please select the correct authorizer as of June 30, 2020 or you may not be assigned the correct tasks. 

BOARD OF REGENTS 

c. DISTRICT / CSD OF LOCATION 

CSD #31 - STATEN ISLAND 

d. DATE OF INITIAL CHARTER 

4/2009 

e. DATE FIRST OPENED FOR INSTRUCTION 

9/2009 
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f. APPROVED SCHOOL MISSION (Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE authorized schools only) 

MISSION STATEMENT 

Lavelle Prep expects all students to graduate with a strong foundation, which enables students to attend 

as well as succeed in college, as well as in life. We welcome all students, including those with disabilities 

and emotional challenges, and we are steadfast in full integration of all our students. With forward 

thinking, inclusion, positive behavioral supports and an innovative approach, we are a holistic 

educational model. 

g. KEY DESIGN ELEMENTS (Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE authorized schools only) 

KEY DESIGN ELEMENTS (Briefly describe each Key Design Elements (KDE) as presented in the schools 

approved charter. KDEs are those general aspects of the school that are innovative or unique to the 

school’s mission and goals, are core to the school’s overall design, and are critical to its success. 

College Focus - LP provides information about 
colleges, courses & admission requirements. We 

provide awareness of the rigor needed in their 
daily learning as we enable students for college & 

career readiness. We employ a college counselor to 

assist students to navigate & explore college 

options. LP facilitates college visits & invites 

admissions representatives to our building. 
Students have taken the CUNY admissions exam. 
Our learning opportunities include College Now, 
Advanced Placement classes, and classes at St. 
Paul's Nursing School and St. John's University. 

KDE 1 

Inclusion - All class lessons are fully integrated. 
Approximately 40% of our students have IEPs. 
Students receive differentiated instruction based 

on specific needs. We welcome all students 

including those with learning, emotional and social 
struggles. Our Special Education dept. works 

closely with parents and the CSE to ensure each 

students needs are being met within our unique 

setting. Within our integrated classrooms there is 

KDE 2 
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daily differentiated instruction, progress 

monitoring, and teacher assistant support. 
Dually Certified Teachers are at the forefront of our 
mission, as we believe teachers certified in both 

special education as well as a content area of 
specialization are at the heart of our successful, 
integrated classrooms. While Lavelle Prep also 

offers employment to singly credited teachers, 
through our “Pipeline” we have many active 

teachers obtaining the second certification with 

financial support from the organization. Fully 

trained Teacher Assistants are often referred to as 

“the second teacher in the room,” and are an 

integral part of our curricula; helping to facilitate 

daily instruction, differentiation, routines, and in 

helping to meet student’s individual needs. Many 

of our teaching assistants are also part of our 
“Pipeline” where they receive financial support in 

completing the requirements for them to become 

fully certified teachers, so that we may hire them 

as teachers once all requirements are met. We are 

consistently growing and promoting our staff 
members as they grow with the organization. 

Integration of Technology: Technology is woven into 

each curriculum in an array of methods. With each 

classroom equipped with one laptop per student, 
and each high school student given their own 

personal tablet that they get to keep upon 

graduation, students have instant and consistent 
computer access whenever it is required or 
needed. Each classroom is also equipped with a 

projector, as well as SmartBoards and Mimios in 

many classrooms throughout the building. Teachers 

are provided technology training and review each 

year so that they may plan each lesson with a tech 

focus. We also utilize methods of targeted 

academic interventions that are often digitally 

based, including I-Ready Diagnostics, Scantron, 
Achieve 3000, and more. 

KDE 3 

Data-Driven Instruction - Our data is drawn from a 

variety of assessments and is utilized to guide 

instruction, measure student performance, and 

KDE 4 
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monitor staff performance. Student performance 

data are used as feedback to teachers and 

administrators on the effectiveness of curriculum 

and instruction in individual classrooms and across 

grade levels; and to identify students in need of 
additional instructional support within classrooms 

and beyond—e.g. tutoring, after- school program, 
Saturday and Career School. 
In order to ensure that we are using the data 

productively, we created the full-time, year-round 

position of Director of Program Evaluation 

beginning in the 2016-2017 academic year. 
Historically, Lavelle Prep has done an excellent job 

using data to drive curriculum changes, (some 

examples include altering the middle school math 

curriculum to include more Algebraic skills, shifting 

middle school English to focus on shorter thematic 

units, etc.), but we have not been as effective 

using aggregated data, as our ability to 

consistently produce this information had been 

limited. However, through the creation of this 

position, we are now able to produce aggregate 

data in manner that enables a quick turnaround, 
leading to effective analysis made readily 

accessible to our teams. We are now able to collect 
assessment data, as well as survey and 

satisfaction data, and disseminate it to our teams 

during their weekly and bi- weekly meetings. 
Additionally, our mid-year retreat and summer 
reflection sessions now have targeted, organized 

data to drive instructional and organizational 
change. This new-level data, in addition to our 
classroom data, is disseminated to the coaches, 
leaders, and teachers to ensure it is, and will 
continue to be used effectively. On the classroom 

level, teachers and coaches use data from the 

classroom and school in meetings to evaluate and 

adjust instruction as necessary. On the school 
level, administration can use this information to 

evaluate how individual programs as well as 

school-wide initiatives are working and make 

adjustments with the teams as necessary. 

Wellness Curriculum: Our Wellness program 

continues to be at the heart of our mission, daily. 
KDE 5 
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Through this growing program, students participate 

in Wellness class under the direction of a trained 

Wellness teacher, who also takes on the role of 
mentor, confidant and guide whenever needed. 
The curriculum is scaffold, and begins in grade 

three where students learn how to best express 

their feelings and resolve conflict, and works up 

through twelfth grade where students face and 

discuss adolescent issues, practice mindfulness 

and meditation, self-regulation and processes for 
goal achievement. 
Regardless of age or grade, through Wellness all 
students gain the skills and knowledge to make 

their goals a reality, manage their own personal 
challenges and struggles, and learn 

communication skills to help them become well 
rounded and of a sound mind, further enhancing 

their academic experience. 
As the program has grown, Wellness teachers now 

implement researched based practices of DBT -
Dialectical Behavioral Therapy (upper grades) as 

well as the Sanford Harmony Program (lower 
grades) for a program grounded in demonstrated 

efficacy and success. 

Challenging Academic Curricula and High 

Expectations: All LP curricula is carefully aligned to 

the Common Core Standards, with the ultimate 

goal of graduating all high school seniors with 

Regents Diplomas. Beginning in the third grade 

and following the Backwards Design model, all 
curricula is curated with the basis of understanding 

of what is needed to get to college and career 
readiness. In each grade through eighth, students 

track and maintain their own I-Can statement 
portfolios, where they monitor their personal 
mastery of each CCSS skill on their own, along with 

guidance from their teacher. Via differentiated 

instruction, each student is provided instruction 

based on their unique needs and levels, with the 

understanding that work is to be rigorous at all 
times. 
Through our targeted interventions called 

Advancements, students are presented with 

additional work on the CCSS standards, split into 

KDE 6 
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KDE 7 

homogenous groups based on specific skill and 

standard, that cycles biweekly with a culminating 

assessment to track progress. The LP Targeted 

Literacy Program rooted in the Orton Gillingham 

method is used for ELA. Programs such as iReady 

accelerate the development of struggling Math and 

English students. These employ the sheltered 

instruction pedagogy. Advanced students are 

provided with enrichment activities and leveled 

instruction/assignments to maintain engagement 
and achievement. In the classroom, teachers strive 

to teach to each student’s levels, and employ a 

multitude of strategies to ensure that each student 
is growing at an appropriate pace. 
In alignment with our high expectations, our 
standard promotional policy requires students to 

demonstrate mastery of 65% of all course content 
(as measured by I-Can statements) as well as 

uphold satisfactory attendance requirements in 

order to be promoted to the next grade. By 

focusing on academic promotion as opposed to 

social or modified promotion, we further ensure our 
students graduate from Lavelle Prep not only ready 

for their own unique college and career pathways, 
but also by having met our challenging and 

rigorous criteria. 

Small Classes: Lavelle Prep ensures consistent 
small class sizes, no larger than 18 students per 
cohort/class, through our lottery system. Each 

spring at our annual lottery we draw numbers for 
each application and fill our classes in succession. 
With our weighted lottery to ensure our targeted 

40% of Special Education students with IEPs, we 

further ensure our classes are balanced and at 
capacity. In out elementary and middle school, the 

classes of 18 and under stay together for the full 
day, as their subjects and teachers change. In our 
High School students are provided with individual 
academic schedules, still only filling classes up to 

18 students. Through the small class sizes, 
students experience more personalized, targeted 

and meaningful learning while building positive 

interpersonal relationships with their teachers, TAs 

and classmates. 

7 / 60 



	 	

	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	

	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	

     

        

       

        

       

       

        

          

       

       

      

          

      

      

         

         

 

     

     

        

       

       

    

       

      

        

        

     

         

       

        

        

        

        

  

  

     

       

       

         

       

      

      

        

  

   

Challenging Academic Curricula and High 

Expectations: All LP curricula is carefully aligned to 

the Common Core Standards, with the ultimate 

goal of graduating all high school seniors with 

Regents Diplomas. Beginning in the third grade 

and following the Backwards Design model, all 
curricula is curated with the basis of understanding 

of what is needed to get to college and career 
readiness. In each grade through eighth, students 

track and maintain their own I-Can statement 
portfolios, where they monitor their personal 
mastery of each CCSS skill on their own, along with 

guidance from their teacher. Via differentiated 

instruction, each student is provided instruction 

based on their unique needs and levels, with the 

understanding that work is to be rigorous at all 
times. 
Through our targeted interventions called 

Advancements, students are presented with 

additional work on the CCSS standards, split into 

homogenous groups based on specific skill and 

standard, that cycles biweekly with a culminating 

assessment to track progress. 
In alignment with our high expectations, our 
standard promotional policy requires students to 

demonstrate mastery of 65% of all course content 
(as measured by I-Can statements) as well as 

uphold satisfactory attendance requirements in 

order to be promoted to the next grade. By 

focusing on academic promotion as opposed to 

social or modified promotion, we further ensure our 
students graduate from Lavelle Prep not only ready 

for their own unique college and career pathways, 
but also by having met our challenging and 

rigorous criteria. 

KDE 8 

Constructivist Teaching: Through our academic 

planning sessions that take place each summer 
and throughout the school year, teachers and 

coaches plan units of instruction with a focus on 

“big picture concepts” with an experiential learning 

focus. By consistently planning with the 

constructivist method in mind, teachers embrace 

the concept that our students learn best by 

KDE 9 
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constructing their own knowledge, and use 

metacognition as a means to provide students time 

to not only acquire new knowledge and 

information, but to also process it in their personal 
way as they identify their role as learners and 

students. 
A prime example of Constructivist Teaching at 
Lavelle Prep can be found within our 7th grade 

partnership with Historic Richmond Town. Through 

this, students independently investigate actual 
court cases that happened at the historic town in 

our borough. They then use skill acquired in drama, 
social studies, and ELA classes to construct their 
own scripts and reenactments of the court cases, 
making meaning of the event through a dramatic 

lens. These dramas are filmed and edited by our 
high school students under supervision from their 
visual arts teacher, and are showcased at an 

annual film festival at a local movie theatre. It is 

through hands on, experiential projects like these 

that our students are their own creators of 
knowledge. 

Behavioral Management System: Our Positive 

Behavioral Supports system is evident throughout 
each school day in a multitude of ways. Through 

our Daily Points System, students have the 

opportunity to earn points for demonstrating 

behaviors aligned with our code of conduct split 
into 5 categories – On Task, On Time, In Seat, 
Prepared, and Listening and Considerate. These 

points are awarded each period, each day. In 

earning “Prep Points,” this incentive based system 

helps to motivate student behavior, and 

encourage/support students to continue to 

demonstrate such behaviors so that they become a 

constant presence not only within our building, but 
within their daily lives as well. Prep Points are 

redeemable at our school Points Store for anything 

from healthy snacks, to brand name headphones 

that students can save points for months, and even 

years to redeem. By offering an array of incentives, 
students stay engaged and motivated as they 

“save up” to earn what they’d like. 
In addition to Prep Points, our guidance 

KDE 10 
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802 

department also works with teachers and the 

Behavioral Intervention Team when necessary, to 

develop individualized behavior plans and reward 

systems for struggling students. For students 

struggling with in class behaviors such as 

preparedness, calling out, attentiveness, etc. they 

are provided with goal charts that are monitored 

and sent home daily, ultimately leading up to 

achieving a goal or positive reward. This system 

helps bridge the gap between home and school 
communication, as well as offers a positive channel 
for students to measure their own growth and 

success. 

Need additional space for variables 

No 

h. SCHOOL WEB ADDRESS (URL) 

http://lavelleprep.org/ 

i. TOTAL MAX APPROVED ENROLLMENT FOR THE 2019-2020 SCHOOL YEAR (exclude Pre-K 

program enrollment) 

j. TOTAL STUDENT ENROLLMENT ON JUNE 30, 2020 (exclude Pre-K program enrollment) 
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k. GRADES SERVED IN SCHOOL YEAR 2019-2020 (exclude Pre-K program students) 

Check all that apply 

Grades Served 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 

l1. DOES THE SCHOOL CONTRACT WITH A CHARTER OR EDUCATIONAL MANAGEMENT 

ORGANIZATION? 

No 

FACILITIES INFORMATION 

m. FACILITIES 

Will the school maintain or operate multiple sites in 2020-2021? 

No, just one site. 

School Site 1 (Primary) 
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m1. SCHOOL SITES 

Please provide information on Site 1 for the upcoming school year. 

Physical Phone Number District/CSD Grades to be 

Address Served at Site 

for coming 

year (K-5, 6-9, 
etc.) 

Receives 

Rental 
Assistance for 
Which Grades 

(If yes, enter 
the appropriate 

grades. If no, 
enter No). 

1 Teleport 
Drive Staten Site 1 NYC CSD 31 K-12 k-5, 11-12 Island, NY 

10311 
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m1a. Please provide the contact information for Site 1. 

Work Phone Alternate Phone Email Address Name 

Dhurata Rexha, 
Kristina Mazza, 
and Jenna Curran 

Dana Volini 

Dana Volini 

Mary Cottingham 

Lee Poerio 

Jenna Curran 

School Leader 

Operational Leader 

Compliance 

Contact 

Complaint Contact 

DASA Coordinator 

Phone Contact for 
After Hours 

Emergencies 

m1b. Is site 1 in public (co-located) space or in private space? 

Private Space 
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IF LOCATED IN PRIVATE SPACE IN NYC OR IN DISTRICTS OUTSIDE NYC 

m1d. Upload a current Certificate of Occupancy (COO) and the annual Fire Inspection Report 

for school site 1 if located in private space in NYC or located outside of NYC . 

Certificate of Occupancy and Fire Inspection. Provide a copy of a current and non-expired 

certificate of occupancy (if outside NYC or in private space in NYC). For schools that are not in 

district space (NYC co-locations), provide a copy of a current and non-expired certificate of 

occupancy, and a copy of the current annual fire inspection results, which should be dated on 

or after July 1, 2020. 

Site 1 Certificate of Occupancy (COO) 

Temp Certificate of Occupancy CC1 CofO.pdf 

Filename: Temp Certificate of Occupancy CC1 CofO.pdf Size: 31.3 kB 

Site 1 Fire Inspection Report 

fire inspection Jan 2020 cc1.pdf 

Filename: fire inspection Jan 2020 cc1.pdf Size: 207.3 kB 

CHARTER REVISIONS DURING THE 2019-2020 SCHOOL YEAR 

n1. Were there any revisions to the school’s charter during the 2019-2020 school year? (Please 

include approved or pending material and non-material charter revisions). 

Yes 
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n2. Summary of Charter Revisions 

1 

5 

Category (Select 
Best Description) 

Change in Grade 

Level 
Configuration 

Change in Bylaws 

Specific Revision 

(150 word limit) 

Change enrollment 
pattern, not to 

open k-2 in 19-20 

Date Approved by Date Approved by 

BOT (if applicable) Authorizer (if 
applicable) 

08/22/2019 04/30/2020 

Change in 

2 student/family update handbook 02/26/2020 03/23/2020 

handbook 

Change enrollment Change in Grade pattern, not to 3 Level 04/23/2020 05/20/2020 open k-2 2017-Configuration 2019 

Updated Conflict of 
Interest Policy to 4 Other 08/22/2019 10/16/2019 update complaint 
language 

Updated 6 th 

Amended Bylaws 

to add Chair 
instead of co-
chairs 

08/22/2019 10/16/2019 

More revisions to add? 

Yes 
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7 

8 

9 

10 

n2. Summary of Charter Revisions 

Category (Select Specific Revision Date Approved by Date Approved by 

Best Description) (150 word limit) BOT (if applicable) Authorizer (if 
applicable) 

Updated 

Family/Student Change in 6 Complaint Policy to 08/22/2019 10/16/2019 complaint policy include new 

Direcotr of HR 

PLEASE NOTE CHARTER SCHOOLS WILL NO LONGER SUBMIT FINANCIAL STATEMENTS, ANNUAL 

BUDGETS, AND RELATED FISCAL DATA VIA THE ANNUAL REPORT. HOWEVER, NYSED BOARD OF 

REGENTS WOULD LIKE TO KNOW IF YOUR SCHOOL'S BOARD OF TRUSTEES HAS APPROVED A 

BUDGET FOR THE 2020-2021 FISCAL YEAR. 

o. Has your school's Board of Trustee's approved a budget for the 2020-2021 FY? 

Yes 

ATTESTATION 
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p. Individual Primarily Responsible for Submitting the Annual Report. 

Name Yelena Osores 

Position Director of Program Evaluation 

Phone/Extension 

Email 

p. Our signatures (Executive Director/School Leader/Head of School and Board President) 

below attest that all of the information contained herein is truthful and accurate and that this 

charter school is in compliance with all aspects of its charter, and with all pertinent Federal, 

State, and local laws, regulations, and rules. We understand that if any information in any part 

of this report is found to have been deliberately misrepresented, that will constitute grounds 

for the revocation of our charter. Check YES if you agree and then use the mouse on your PC or 

the stylus on your mobile device to sign your name). 

Responses Selected: 

Yes 

Signature, Head of Charter School 
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Signature, President of the Board of Trustees 

Date 

Jul 21 2020 

Thank you. 

Entry 2 NYS School Report Card 

Completed Jul 21 2020 Hidden from applicant 

Instructions 

SUNY-authorized charter schools only 

Provide a direct web link to the most recent New York State School Report Card for the charter school 
(See https://reportcards.nysed.gov/) . This report captures school-level enrollment and demographic 
information, staff qualifications, electronic student records, and attendance rates, as prescribed by New 
York State statute (8 NYCRR 119.3). 

Entry 2 NYS School Report Card Link 

JOHN W LAVELLE PREPARATORY CHARTER SCHOOL 353100860959 

18 / 60 
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1. ACADEMIC STUDENT PERFORMANCE GOALS 

For the 2019-2020 school year, any academic goals
that cannot be evaluated due to school closure 
resulting in a lack of data and changes in testing, 
surveying, and other usual practices should be 
reported as “N/A”. 

2019-20 Progress Toward Attainment of Academic Goals 

If not met, 
describe efforts 

the school will take 

to meet goal. If 
unable to assess 

goal, type N/A for 
Not Applicable 

1ai. ESEA 

Accountability 

Designation. NYSED ESEA Reward, Good Academic Goal 1 accountability Met Standing, Local report Assistance Plan, 
Focus or Priority 

School Status 

1bi. Comparative 

Proficiency 

Comparison of the 

performance of all 
schools in NYS with 

the same grade 

configuration and 

similar population 

of students 

identified as 

economically 

Academic Student 
Performance Goal 

Measure Used to 

Evaluate Progress 

Toward Attainment 
of Goal 

Goal - Met, Not 
Met or Unable to 

Assess 

20 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	
	

	

	
	 	

	 	
	 	 	

	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	 	

	 	

	

	

	 	 	
	

	
	

	 	
	

	 	
	

	 	
	

	
	 	

	 	
	

	 	
	

	

	 	
	 	 	 	

	

 

  

  

     

 

  

   

 

 

   

   

   

 

 

   

   

 

 

  

 

  

 

    

  

  

  

   

  

   

     
   

  

 

 

  

   

   

  

   

  

  

       

   

       

 

  

 

  

disadvantaged, 
students with 

disabilities and 

Academic Goal 2 English language 

learners. 
Performance is 

based on schools’ 
aggregate 

proficiency 

compared to the 

NYS average on 3-
8 ELA and 

mathematics 

assessments 

and/or high school 
cohort ELA and 

mathematics 

outcomes. 

2ai. Aggregate 

Standards-Based 

Trend Toward 

Proficiency 

75% of students in 

the school 
maintaining a 

proficient testing 

level or trending 

toward proficiency 

from one year’s 

test administration Academic Goal 3 
to the next. 
Analysis will 
examine 

proficiency 

maintenance or 
improvement of all 
students in the 

school compared 

to each student’s 

previous year’s 

test scores. 

Provided by NYS Unable to Assess na 

New York State 

Math and ELA Unable to Assess na 

examination 

2aii. Subgroup 

Standards-Based 

21 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	

	 	 	
	

	
	

	 	
	

	 	
	

	 	
	

	
	

	 	
	 	

	
	

	

	 	
	

	 	

	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	

	
	

	 	 	
	

	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	 	
	 	

	 	

	 	 	

	
	

	 	 	

  

 

    

  

  

  

   

  

   

  

   

  

    

 

  

  

   

   

 

 

  

  

  

 

   

  

   

  

  

 

    

  

   
   

   

   

    

   

   

 

   

       

 

      

  

  

 

    

  

Trend Toward 

Proficiency 

75% of students in 

the school 
maintaining a 

proficient testing 

level or trending 

toward proficiency 

from one year’s 

test administration 

to the next. 
Analysis will 

Academic Goal 4 examine 

proficiency 

maintenance or 
improvement of 
students in the 

school who are 

economically 

disadvantaged, 
students with 

disabilities, and 

English language 

learners, 
compared to each 

student’s previous 

year’s test scores. 

2bi. Aggregate 

School Level 
Proficiency 

% of students who 

score proficiently 

on 3-8 state Academic Goal 5 assessments for all 
students at the 

school level will be 

greater than that 
of the community 

district. 

New York State 

Math and ELA Unable to Assess na 

examination 

NYSED Data Unable to Assess na 

2bii. Subgroup 

School Level 
Proficiency 

% of students who 

22 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	
	 	

	
	 	

	
	 	
	

	 	

	
	

	
	 	
	 	

	 	

	 	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	 	
	

	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	

	
	 	
	
	 	

	
	

	
	 	

	
	 	

	 	
	 	
	
	
	

  

   

  

   

  

      
  

   

 

 

  

  

  

   

   

   

 

   

 

    

  

   

      

   

   

   

   

 

  

  

    

    

  

   

  

   

  

  

  

   

  

   

   

   

  

  

  

  

score proficiently 

on 3-8 state 

assessments by 

subgroup at the 

school level 
compared to the Academic Goal 6 
subgroup. Includes 

students who are 

economically 

disadvantaged, 
students with 

disabilities and 

English language 

learners will be 

greater than that 
of the community 

district. 

2biii. Grade Level 
Proficiency 

% of students who 

score proficiently 

on 3-8 state 

Academic Goal 7 assessments for all 
students by grade 

level will be 

greater than that 
of the community 

district. 

NYSED Data 

NYSED Data 

Unable to Assess na 

Unable to Assess na 

Though students 

were unable to 

take Regents 

exams in June, 
Mock Regents 

exams were 

administered. 71% 

of students were 

proficient in 

algebra based on 

the Algebra Mock 

Regents. 50% of 
students were 

proficient in 

geometry based 

23 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	
	

	
	

	 	
	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	

	 	
	 	
	
	

	 	 	
	 	
	 	
	 	
	 	 	
	
	 	
	 	
	
	 	 	

	 	
	
	
	

	 	
	 	
	
	 	

	 	
	 	
	 	
	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	
	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	

	
	

	
	

	 	
	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	

   

   

  

   

   

  

  

 

  

  

   

   

   

   

   

  

  

 

  

  

   

  

   

   

   

     

  

    

   

   

   

    

  

   

   

  

    

   

  

  

  

   

   

  

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

  

   

   

   

      

  

on the Mock 

Regents. 91% of 
students were 

Academic Goal 8 

Academic Goal 9 

3ai. Aggregate 

Annual Regents 

Outcomes 

Annual Regents 

testing outcomes 

for every tested 

subject for all 
students will be 

greater than that 
of the state. 

3aii. Subgroup 

Annual Regents 

Outcomes 

Annual Regents 

testing outcomes 

for every tested 

subject by 

subgroup will be 

greater than that 
of the state. 

NYSED Data Unable to Assess 

proficient in 

Algebra II based on 

the Mock Regents. 
87% of students 

were proficient in 

ELA based on the 

Mock Regents. 
76% of students 

were proficient in 

living environment 
based on the Mock 

Regents. 76% of 
students were 

proficient in 

chemistry based 

on the Mock 

Regents. 100% of 
students were 

proficient in Earth 

science based on 

the Mock Regents. 
95% of students 

were proficient in 

U.S. history based 

on the Mock 

Regents. 87% of 
students were 

proficient in global 
history based on 

the Mock Regents. 

NYSED Data Unable to Assess na 

24 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	
	

	

	
	

	

	
	 	
	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

	
	

	 	
	

	
	

	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	

	
	 	

	

	 	

	
	

	

	
	

	

	
	 	
	

	 	 	

   

  

  

  

 

  

  

  

 

  

   

   

   

   

   

      

        

 

       

   

  

  

  

  

  

 

  

  

  

 

  

   

  

      

      

   

  

     

 

  

   

 

  

   

  

 

  

Academic Goal 10 

3aiii. Aggregate 

Total Cohort 
Regents Testing 

Outcomes 

Cohort Regents 

testing outcomes 

for ELA, 
mathematics, 
science, Global 
History and US 

History for all 
students will be 

greater than that 
of the state. 

NYSED Data Unable to Assess na 

2. Do have more academic goals to add? 

Yes 

2019-2020 Progress Toward Attainment of Academic Goals 

Academic Goal 11 

Academic Student 
Performance Goal 

3aiv. Subgroup 

Total Cohort 
Regents Testing 

Outcomes 

Cohort Regents 

testing outcomes 

for ELA, 
mathematics, 
science, Global 
History and US 

History by 

Measure Used to Goal - Met, Not 
Evaluate Progress Met or Unable to 

Toward Attainment Assess 

of Goal 

NYSED Data Unable to Assess 

2019-2020 

progress toward 

attainment of goal 
Met/Not 
Met/Unable to 

Assess During Due 

to Closure 

na 

25 / 60 



	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	

	 	

	
	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	
	 	

	 	

	
	

	 	
	 	

	
	

	
	

	
	 	

	 	

	 	

	
	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	 	

	 	 	

	 	

	 	
	 	
	 	 	

	 	
	 	 	 	
	
	
	 	

	 	 	

   

   

   

  

  

 

      

   

    

   

  

  

 

   

   

  

     

 

  

  

  

   

   

  

  

 

    

    

       

   

   

   

    

 

  

   

    

   

     
   

  

  

   

  

  

      

      

  

subgroup will be 

greater than that 
of the state. 

3bi. Aggregate 

Cohort Graduation 

Rate 

Academic Goal 12 4-year and 5-year 
graduation rate for 
all students will be 

80% or greater. 

3bii. Subgroup 

Cohort Graduation 

Rate 

4-year and 5-year 
graduation rate for 
students identified 

Academic Goal 13 as economically 

disadvantaged, 
students with 

disabilities, and 

English language 

learners will be 

80% or greater. 

3biii. Aggregate 

On-Track to 

Graduate 

75% of all students 

in a cohort that 
Academic Goal 14 have passed 3 out 

of 5 Regents 

exams required for 
graduation by their 
3rd year of high 

school. 

3biv. Subgroup On-
Track to Graduate 

75% of cohort by 

subgroup that has 

passed 3 out of 5 Academic Goal 15 Regents exams 

required for 
graduation by their 

ATS Met 

ATS Met 

Regents Exams Unable to Assess na 

Regents Exams Unable to Assess na 

26 / 60 



	 	

	 	 	

	 	

	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	
	 	

	 	
	
	 	
	

	

	 	

	

	 	
	

	
	

	
	 	 	

	 	
	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	

	

	

	 	

	 	
	

	 	 	
	

	 	

	 	
	 	
	

	
	

    

 

   

   

  

 

 

    

   

   

   

   

  

   

  

  

 

 

   

  

 

 

  

  

  

   

   

   

   

   

   

  

 

   

   

   

   
  

    

  

 
 

 

   

   

   

  

  

 

  
 

 

  

3rd year of high 

school. 

Academic Goal 16 

Academic Goal 17 

3bv. Aggregate 

Student 
Persistence 

85% of students in 

a 4-year and 5-
year cohort that 
remain enrolled in 

the school until 
they graduate 

from the high 

school program. 

3bvi. Subgroup 

Student 
Persistence 

85% of students 

identified as 

economically 

disadvantaged, 
students with 

disabilities, and 

English language 

learners in a 4-
year and 5-year 
cohort that remain 

enrolled in the 

school until they 

graduate from the 

high school 
program. 

Level 2 Met 

Level 2 Met 

LP1. 90% of 

Academic Goal 18 
graduates will 
apply to college or 

Staff collected 

data 
Met 

university 

Academic Goal 19 

LP2. 90% of 
graduates will be 

accepted to 

college or 
university 

Staff collected Met data 

27 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	
	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	
	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	
	 	 	

	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

   

        

 

   

      
        

          
       

   

       

          

         

     

    

   

    

  

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

  

Academic Goal 20 

3. Do have more academic goals to add? 

No 

4. ORGANIZATION GOALS 

For the 2019-2020 school year, any organization
goals that cannot be evaluated due to school closure
resulting in a lack of data and changes in testing, 
surveying, and other usual practices should be 
reported as “N/A”. 

2019-2020 Progress Toward Attainment of Organization Goals 

Organizational Measure Used to Goal - Met, Not If not met, 
Goal Evaluate Progress Met, or Unable to describe efforts 

Assess the school will take 

to meet goal. If 
unable to assess 

goal, type N/A for 
Not Applicable 

Org Goal 1 

Org Goal 2 

Org Goal 3 

Org Goal 4 

Org Goal 5 

Org Goal 6 

Org Goal 7 

Org Goal 8 

Org Goal 9 

28 / 60 



	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	
	

	 	 	
	 	

	 	
	

	 	 	
	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

	 	

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

   

        

 

   

       

  

   

   

   

   

   

   

  

   

   

 

   

  

    

   

  

Org Goal 10 

Org Goal 11 

Org Goal 12 

Org Goal 13 

Org Goal 14 

Org Goal 15 

Org Goal 16 

Org Goal 17 

Org Goal 18 

Org Goal 19 

Org Goal 20 

5. Do have more organizational goals to add? 

No 

6. FINANCIAL GOALS 

2019-2020 Progress Toward Attainment of Financial Goals 

Financial Goal 1 

Financial Goals Measure Used to 

Evaluate Progress 

Goal - Met, Not 
Met, or Partially 

Met 

If not met, 
describe efforts 

the school will take 

to meet goal. 

Financial Goal 2 

Financial Goal 3 

Financial Goal 4 

Financial Goal 5 
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7. Do have more financial goals to add? 

(No response) 

2019-2020 Progress Toward Attainment of Financial Goals 

Financial Goal 6 

Financial Goals Measure Used to 

Evaluate Progress 

Goal - Met, Not 
Met, or Partially 

Met 

If not met, 
describe efforts 

the school will take 

to meet goal. 

Financial Goal 7 

Financial Goal 8 

Financial Goal 9 

Financial Goal 10 

Thank you. 

Entry 3 Accountability Plan Progress Reports 

Incomplete Hidden from applicant 

Instructions 

SUNY-Authorized Charter Schools ONLY 

SUNY-authorized charter schools must download 
an Accountability Plan Progress Report template. After 
completing, schools must upload the document into the by 
September 15, 2020. 
Entry 7 Disclosure of Financial Interest Form 

Completed Jul 26 2020 

Instructions - Multiple Uploads Permitted 
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Required of ALL Charter Schools by August 3 

Each member of the charter school’s Board of Trustees who served on a charter school education 
corporation governing one or more charter schools for any period during the 2019-2020 school year must 
complete a signed: 

Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE Authorized Schools: Disclosure of Financial Interest 
Form 
SUNY- Authorized Charter Schools: Trustee Financial Disclosure Form 

All completed forms must be collected and uploaded in .PDF format for each individual member. If a 
trustee is not able or available to complete the form by the deadline, the education corporation is 
responsible for doing so on behalf of the trustee. (Forms completed from past years will not be accepted). 

Trustees serving on an education corporation that governs more than one school are not required to 
complete a separate disclosure for each school governed by the education corporation. In the Disclosure 
of Financial Interest Form, trustees must disclose information relevant to any of the schools served by the 
governing education corporation. 

Board Financial Disclosures 19-20 

Filename: Board Financial Disclosures 19 20 YkqlRc8.pdf Size: 1.7 MB 

Entry 8 BOT Membership Table 

Completed Jul 31 2020 

Instructions 

Required of All charter schools 

ALL charter schools or education corporations governing 
multiple schools must complete the Board of Trustees 
Membership Table within the online portal. Please be sure 
to include and identify parents who are members of the 
Board of Trustees and indicate whether parents are voting 
or non-voting members. 
Entry 8 BOT Table 

1. SUNY-AUTHORIZED charter schools are required to provide information for VOTING Trustees only. 
2. REGENTS, NYCDOE, and BUFFALO BOE-AUTHORIZED charter schools are required to provide 

information for all --VOTING and NON-VOTING-- trustees. 

JOHN W LAVELLE PREPARATORY CHARTER SCHOOL 353100860959 
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1. 2019-2020 Board Member Information (Enter info for each BOT member) 

Trustee 

Name 

and 

Email 
Address 

Sheldon 

Blackma 

1 n 

Michael 
Caridi 

2 

Joseph 

Carroll 
3 

Bonnie 

Fritz 

4 

Denise 

Henick 

5 

Robin 

Position 

on the 

Board 

Trustee/M 

ember 

Trustee/M 

ember 

Secretary 

Trustee/M 

ember 

Trustee/M 

ember 

Committ 
ee 

Affiliation 

s 

None 

Fundraisi 
ng 

Governm 

ent and 

Nominati 
ng, 
Finance, 
Executive 

Educatio 

n 

Fundraisi 
ng 

Voting 

Member 
Per By-
Laws 

(Y/N) 

Yes 

Yes 

Yes 

Yes 

Yes 

Number 
of Terms 

Served 

2 

2 

2 

1 

1 

Start 
Date of 
Current 
Term 

(MM/DD/ 
YYYY) 

11/1/201 

9 

11/1/201 

8 

11/1/201 

9 

11/1/201 

7 

10/1/201 

8 

End Date 

of 
Current 
Term 

(MM/DD/ 
YYYY) 

11/30/20 

22 

11/30/20 

21 

11/30/20 

22 

11/30/20 

20 

11/30/20 

21 

Board 

Meetings 

Attended 

During 

2019-
2020 

9 

6 

9 

9 

6 
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Lefkowitz Trustee/M Governan 11/1/201 11/30/20 6 Yes 2 5 or less ember ce and 9 22 
Nominati 
ng 

David 

Lehr 
7 

Deborah 

Miller 

8 

Jill Patel 

9 

Treasurer 

Chair 

Vice 

Chair 

Executive 

, Finance, 
Governan 

ce and 

Nominati 
ng 

Executive 

, 
Educatio 

n, 
Governan 

ce and 

Nominati 
ng 

Executive 

, Finance, 
Fundraisi 
ng 

Yes 

Yes 

Yes 

2 

1 

2 

11/1/201 

9 

11/1/201 

7 

11/1/201 

9 

11/30/20 9 20 

11/30/20 8 20 

11/30/20 10 21 

1a. Are there more than 9 members of the Board of Trustees? 

Yes 
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1b. Current Board Member Information 

Trustee Position Committ Voting Number Start End Date Board 

Name on the ee Member of Terms Date of of Meetings 

and Board Affiliation Per By- Served Current Current Attended 

Email s Laws Term Term During 

Address (Y/N) (MM/DD/ (MM/DD/ 2019-
YYYY) YYYY) 2020 

Doris 

schueler 

Trustee/M Educatio 11/1/201 11/30/20 10 Yes 2 6 ember n 9 22 

John 

Strand Trustee/M Educatio 10/1/201 11/30/20 11 Yes 1 7 ember n 9 22 

Dirk Executive Tillotson Trustee/M , 11/1/201 11/30/20 12 Yes 1 6 ember Educatio 7 20 

n 

Eleni 
Tournaki Trustee/M Educatio 11/1/201 11/30/20 13 Yes 2 10 ember n 9 22 

14 

15 
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10 

1c. Are there more than 15 members of the Board of Trustees? 

No 

2. INFORMATION ABOUT MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES 

1. SUNY-AUTHORIZED charter schools provide response relative to VOTING Trustees only. 
2. REGENTS, NYCDOE, and BUFFALO BOE-AUTHORIZED charter schools provide a response relative to 

all trustees. 

a. Total Number of BOT Members on June 30, 2020 

b.Total Number of Members Added During 2019-
2020 

c. Total Number of Members who Departed during 

2019-2020 

d.Total Number of members, as set in Bylaws, 
Resolution or Minutes 

13 

1 

2 

5-25 

3. Number of Board meetings held during 2019-2020 

4. Number of Board meetings scheduled for 2020-2021 

Thank you. 

Entry 9 Board Meeting Minutes 

Completed Jul 21 2020 

Instructions 
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Schools must upload a complete set of monthly board meeting minutes (July 2019-June 2020), which 
should match the number of meetings held during the 2019-2020 school year, as indicated in the above 
table. The minutes provided must be the final version approved by the school’s Board of Trustees and 
may be uploaded individually or as one single combined file. Board meeting minutes must be submitted 
by August 3, 2020. 

Board Minutes - ALL 19-20 

Filename: Board Minutes ALL 19 20 UJQP2wR.pdf Size: 4.0 MB 

Entry 10 Enrollment & Retention 

Completed Sep 29 2020 

Instructions for submitting Enrollment and Retention Efforts 
ALL charter schools must complete this section. Describe the efforts 
the charter school has made toward meeting targets in 2018-2019 to 
attract and retain enrollment of Students with Disabilities (SWDs), English Language 

Learners/Multilingual Learners (ELLs/MLLs), and students who are economically disadvantaged. In 
addition, describe the school’s plans for meeting or making progress 
toward meeting its enrollment and retention targets in 2019-2020. 

Entry 10 Enrollment and Retention of Special
Populations 

Instructions for Reporting Enrollment and Retention Strategies 

Describe the efforts the charter school has made in 2019-2020 toward 

meeting targets to attract and retain enrollment of students with disabilities, 
English language learners/Multilingual learners, and students who are 

economically disadvantaged. In addition, describe the school’s plans for 
meeting or making progress toward meeting its enrollment and retention 

targets in 2020-2021. 

JOHN W LAVELLE PREPARATORY CHARTER SCHOOL 353100860959 

Recruitment/Attraction Efforts Toward Meeting Targets 

Describe Recruitment Efforts in 

2019-2020 

Describe Recruitment Plans in 

2020-2021 

Enhancing all 19-20 efforts and: 

Scheduled more frequent virtual 
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Hosted our own open houses and 

community events as well as 

attended broader community 

events including NYCDOE fairs. 
This was done in person before 

Covid-19 and virtually since 

March. In addition, we made use 

of local advertisements in key 

locations to enhance our 
outreach. 

open houses tracking 

participation and including 

students in the presentations. 

For the first time we hosted an 

open house for our 8th graders 

matriculating to high school. 

Placed advertisements in SI 
Parent Magazine and used 

targeted emails advertising. 
Additionally, placed 

advertisements in local 
community businesses. 

Revised our brochure and 

website to better serve as a 

recruitment tool. Put brochure on 

website. 

We changed the format and 

content of our brochure to make 

it more visually appealing and 

plan to distribute these at more 

strategic times this year. 

Promoting pathways from 

elementary to high school within 

the school brochure. 

Created relationships with pre-K 

and day care programs in the zip 

codes of our current enrollment 
and those on the North Shore of 
Staten Island, where the majority 

of Economically Disadvantaged 

families reside. 

Enhanced the website to target 
interested parents as opposed to 

only expecting currently enrolled 

parents to be the audience. 

Established a community 

relationship with the Kiwanis 
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Economically Disadvantaged 

We created an ICS/community 

liaison position to specifically 

reach out to and establish 

relationships with various Staten 

Island Communities with 

particular attention to 

underserved communities. 

Produced promotional films and 

posted the content on social 
media and the website. 

We created a team of staff 
members for our community 

outreach. This will assist us in 

attending more events and 

networking with organizations, 
churches, district schools and 

families across the district. 

We have continued to host our 
own open houses and community 

events as well as attend broader 
community events in order to 

recruit. 

This past year we made use of 
local advertisements in key 

locations to enhance our 
outreach. 

Club of Staten Island to provide 

all students with school supplies. 
The hope is that this will be an 

ongoing relationship so that high 

school students can be more 

engaged in service and so that 
Kiwanis can help promote our 
school 

Created programs with the 

College of Staten Island to 

provide STEM opportunities for 
the students identified as 

economically disadvantaged. 

Personally calling and following 

up with every family that applies 

or attends an open house. 

Increased the ICS Community 

Liaison’s working hours to 

conduct outreach and make 

community connections with 

underserved communities. 

Provided each student with 

technology for the school year. 

HS students have the opportunity 

to choose a pathway of 
learning;Arts/Media/Marketing 

Entertainment as well Health 

Sciences/Medical Technology. 
Preparing them for college and 

career readiness. 

Increased presence on social 
media by creating an enhanced 

recruitment video with parent 
and student testimonials. 

Created morning announcements 

to increase student and family 

engagement. 
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All of the above, and: 

Reached out to local religious 

institutions, community centers 

and businesses to inform the 

community of the school's 

mission and lottery/enrollment 
process. This was done with 

specific focus in communities 

throughout Staten Island that are 

predominantly composed of 
foreign language speakers. 

The brochure and lottery 

application is available in 

multiple languages and staff are 

Participating at the Autism 

Awareness drive-thru event. 

Continued outreach and 

relationship building with 

religious and community based 

organizations as well as for-profit 
business located on Staten Island 

who we can partner with to 

attract students. 

Training teachers in techniques 

on Trauma Informed Teaching to 

incorporate in classroom 

instruction and meet social 
emotional challenges. 

All core subject teachers are 

participating in The Writing 

Revolution training that will 
provide multiple writing 

strategies to all students. 

Recruit diverse staff members to 

emulate our student population. 

All of the above, enhancing and 

improving all 19-20 efforts and: 

We will host our own community 

fairs (virtually) to boost the 

profile of the school as well as 

support the community. 

Translated written materials into 

languages other than english. 

Provided language interpretation 

services at school events. 

Worked with community based 

organizations to increase 

awareness of the school and 

designated a staff member as a 

community liaison to visit our 
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English Language 

Learners/Multilingual Learners 

available to translate in multiple 

languages. 

We also made use of local 
advertisements in key locations 

to enhance our outreach. Flyers 

(mailed, online, and distributed) 
are translated in Arabic and 

Spanish. The Google Translate 

feature is embedded in our 
website. 

Created a partnership with a K-8 

ELL New World Prep Charter 
school. 

We participated and took on 

greater roles in community 

events, especially with our Arabic 

program. 

Lavelle Prep has successfully 

expanded our Adult Language 

Learner class by advertising in 

the communities. The program is 

well received and becoming well 
known. 

Efforts to attract more ELLs 

include translating written 

materials into languages other 
than English, providing 

interpretation services at school 
events, and working with 

community-based organizations 

to increase awareness of the 

school. 

most diverse Staten Island 

community. 

Robo calls have been translated 

into spanish enabling families to 

receive important information. 

Created a bilingual survey to 

determine guardian’s preferred 

language within our community. 

Hired bilingual counselors. 

Worked with bilingual teachers 

who were former ELLs to build 

relationships with their 
communities to attract additional 
students. 

We are building a stronger 
relationship with New World Prep, 
a charter school that targets ELLs 

and only serves students through 

grade 8. 

Lavelle has also created a new 

partnership with the Family Life 

Center located in Stapleton. 
Lavelle staff, including our 
bilingual staff, has participated in 

events hosted by the Family Life 

Center to promote our school 
and increase our ELL population. 

All core subject teachers will 
participate in The Writing 

Revolution training that will 
provide multiple writing 

strategies to all students. 

Recruit diverse staff members to 

emulate our student population. 

All of the above, enhancing all 
19-20 efforts and : 
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Students with Disabilities 

All of the above, and: 

Developed excellent working 

relationships with our local 
district schools. 

Host our own open houses as 

well as attend community events 

to recruit. 

Made use of local advertisements 

in key 

locations to enhance our 
outreach. 

Appointed special education 

coordinators within each division 

of Lavelle Prep. 

Parent testimonial videos were 

added to the Lavelle Prep 

website to provide families with 

information about our school 
from a parent’s perspective who 

have a child with a disability. 
Work with the Committee on 

Special Education and the 

NYCDOE enrollment office to 

locate students that may be a 

good match for our school. 

Streamlined the role of special 
education coordinators to meet 
the needs of our students. 

Build and maintain relationships 

with our local district schools and 

continue to host our own open 

houses as well as attend 

community events and recruit. 
Created relationships with pre-K 

and day care programs that work 

with students with disabilities. 

Work with school based support 
teams from district schools who 

can recommend students that 
may be a good fit for our 
program. 

More specifically share our 
abundance of supports for SWDs 

in our advertisements 

Graduate students with 

disabilities and their families, 
have shared their testimonials as 

they were accepted to college 

and parent testimonial videos 

were created. 
We intend to continue our 
outreach efforts and are looking 

for more opportunities to 
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participate and even take on 

greater roles in community 

events. 
Recruit diverse staff members to 

emulate our student population. 

Retention Efforts Toward Meeting Targets 

Describe Retention Efforts in 

2019-2020 

Lavelle provides support systems 

that include: counselors, staff 
mentors, peer mentors, and 

attentive teachers for each 

student. 

Lavelle keeps a high level of 
communication with our families 

so that they understand their 
child's educational and social-
emotional path. When concerns 

do arise, they are 

addressed immediately. We 

believe this has aided us in our 
retention efforts. Economically Disadvantaged 

42 / 60 

Describe Retention Plans in 

2020-2021 

Enhancing all 19-20 efforts and : 

Increasing family communication 

and support in the virtual 
environment. 

Ensuring all students have 

technology. 

Social workers will provide family 

outreach and connection to 

assistance in relation to internet 
service, food, housing, etc. 

Teachers incorporate Trauma 

Informed Teaching techniques in 

classroom instruction to meet 
social emotional challenges 

The McKinney Vento liaison 

presented to school leadership 

around additional ways to 

identify students who are 

displaced or homeless. 

Provide parent information about 
McKinney Vento support via 

email and connect them with the 

school liaison. 

In a distance learning setting, 
provide school sanctioned social 
opportunities such as gaming 



	 	

	 	 	
	 	

	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	
	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	

	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	
	 	 	

	 	 	
	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	
	 	 	
	 	

	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	

	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	
	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

    

   

   

     

     

   

   

      

     

   

    

    

    

   

        

    

     

   

      

      

    

  

    

    

  

     

    

    

    

   

      

     

   

   

    

     

     

    

      

     

    

     

    

     

    

     

     

    

 

    

    

       

     

       

  

Our community outreach team 

ensures networking with 

organizations, churches, district 
schools and families. This helps 

our organization keep close ties 

with our communities. 

Behavior Intervention teams 

meet weekly to discuss how to 

better support our students both 

academically and behaviorally. 

Our support systems include 

counselors, staff mentors, peer 
mentors, and attentive teachers 

to each student. 

We strive to keep a high level of 
communication with our families 

so that they understand their 
child’s educational and social-

club, story time and movie night. 

A support page was created on 

our school website for 
economically disadvantaged 

parents to get further 
information about support within 

the community. 

Provide arts based After School 
program to offer students 

engagement in the arts 

Provide Saturday school to 

support students academically. 

Offer an hour a week of 
technology support to all families 

during virtual learning. 

Streamlined the Behavior 
Intervention meetings to create 

plans with specific academic and 

behavioral goals for students to 

better meet their needs. 

Enhancing all 19-20 efforts and : 

Lavelle Prep will continue to 

analyze our incoming student 
data home language survey to 

determine our ELL population. 

Lavelle Prep will continue to 

upload parent testimonials in 

Spanish along with materials that 
are frequently given out at 
community events and local 
businesses. 

Our African American community 

advocate and Spanish speaking 

staff will continue to reach out to 

our families sharing the benefits 

of ELL support that we offer at 
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English Language 

Learners/Multilingual Learners 

emotional path while addressing 

any immediate concerns. 

We have translated written 

materials into languages other 
than English and provided 

interpretation services at school 
events. 

We hired a teacher of ELL with 

TESOL certification and created a 

class to support students with 

language acquisition. This 

support helped increase 

students’ academics as well as 

SEL leading to higher retention 

rates. 

Created a Spanish speaking 

family support group facilitated 

by bilingual social workers. 

School is staffed with a full time 

bilingual social worker to support 
students. 

Behavior Intervention teams 

meet weekly to discuss how to 

better support our students both 

academically and behaviorally. 

Lavelle Prep. 

Enhance outreach and 

communication to families in 

their native languages. 

Bilingual counselors work with 

school leadership to increase the 

numbers of parents in the 

language other than English 

speaking support groups. 

In a distance learning setting, 
provide school sanctioned social 
opportunities such as gaming 

club, story time and movie night. 

Specific staff members can 

communicate with families and 

students in their native language 

including Arabic and Spanish. 

Provide arts based After School 
program to offer students 

engagement in the arts 

Provide Saturday school to 

support students academically. 

Offer an hour a week of 
technology support to all families 

during virtual learning. 

Streamlined the Behavior 
Intervention meetings to create 

plans with specific academic and 

behavioral goals for students to 

better meet their needs. 

Enhancing all 19-20 efforts and : 
Lavelle’s Open House now 

incorporates videos detailing our 
programs to understand the 

integrated setting which includes 
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Students with Disabilities 

Supportive and student centered 

environment. 

Counselors, staff mentors, peer 
mentors, and attentive teachers 

work closely with each student 
each student on a daily basis. 
This allows any concerns to be 

addressed immediately. 

High level of communication with 

our families so that they 

understand their child’s 

educational and social-emotional 
path. 

A focus on SDI (Specially 

Designed Instruction) and SAS 

(Supplemental Aids and 

Services). 

A cooperative teaching model for 
a significant number of our 
classes. Every core class led by a 

content specialist now has a 

special education co-teacher 
partnered with them to deliver 
instruction and provide 

appropriate special education 

accommodation to our students. 

Behavior Intervention teams 

meet weekly to discuss how to 

better support our students both 

academically and behaviorally. 

parent testimonials. Families also 

watched a student performance 

and met with some 

upperclassmen and alumni to 

hear about the impact Lavelle 

Prep has made on their lives. , 
including our students with 

disabilities. Lastly, families 

engage in discussions and Q & A 

with our administration and staff 
to address their needs. 
Provide arts based After School 
program to offer students 

engagement in the arts 

Provide Saturday school to 

support students academically. 

In addition to providing the full 
Innovative Charter Model with 

regards to staffing during remote 

and blended learning, we are 

also providing synchronous 

targeted small group instruction 

and individual tutoring as 

needed. 

In a distance learning setting, 
provide school sanctioned social 
opportunities such as gaming 

club, story time and movie night. 

Work with CSE and agencies to 

facilitate student services and 

support while working remotely. 

Implement the MAP test as a 

diagnostic tool to help enhance 

RTI at our school. 
Ensuring all staff members are 

trained in SDI and SAS to 

implement individual instruction 

to meet the unique needs of our 
students. 

Offer an hour a week of 
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technology support to all families 

during virtual learning. 

Streamlined the Behavior 
Intervention meetings to create 

plans with specific academic and 

behavioral goals for students to 

better meet their needs. 

Entry 12 Percent of Uncertified Teachers 

Completed Jul 28 2020 

Instructions 

Required of Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE Authorized Charter Schools ONLY 

The table below reflects the information collected through the online portal for compliance with New 
York State Education Law 2854(3)(a-1) for teaching staff qualifications. Uncertified teachers are those 
not certified pursuant to the State Certification Requirements established by the NYSED Commissioner of 
Education. 

Entry 12 Uncertified Teachers 

School Name: JOHN W LAVELLE PREPARATORY CHARTER SCHOOL 353100860959 

Instructions for Reporting Percent of Uncertified
Teachers 

Required of Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE Authorized Charter Schools 

The table below reflects the information collected through the online portal for compliance 

with New York State Education Law 2854(3)(a-1) for teaching staff qualifications. Uncertified 

teachers are those not certified pursuant to the State Certification Requirements established 

by the NYSED Commissioner of Education. Enter the relevant full-time equivalent (FTE) count 

of teachers in each column. For example, a school with 20 full-time teachers and 5 half-time 

teachers would have an FTE count of 22.5. 

If more than one line applies to a teacher, please include in only one FTE uncertified category. Please do 

not include paraprofessionals, such as teacher aides. 
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CATEGORY A. 30% OR 5 UNCERTIFIED TEACHERS WHICHEVER IS LESS 

FTE Count 

i. FTE count of uncertified teacher with at least 
three years of elementary, middle or secondary 2 classroom teaching experience (as of June 30, 
2020) 

ii. FTE count of uncertified teachers who are 

tenured or tenure track college faculty (as of June 

30, 2020) 

iii. FTE count of uncertified teachers with two years 

of Teach for America experience (as of June 30, 
2020) 

iv. FTE count of uncertified teachers with 

exceptional business, professional, artistic, 3 

athletic, or military experience (as June 30, 2020) 

Total Category A: 5 or 30% whichever is less 5.0 
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CATEGORY B. PLUS FIVE UNCERTIFIED TEACHERS IN MATHEMATICS, SCIENCE, COMPUTER 

SCIENCE, TECHNOLOGY OR CAREER AND TECHNICAL EDUCATION. 

FTE Count 

i. FTE count of uncertified teacher with at least 
three years of elementary, middle or secondary 

classroom teaching experience (as of June 30, 
2020) 

ii. FTE count of uncertified teachers who are 

tenured or tenure track college faculty (as of June 

30, 2020) 

iii. FTE count of uncertified teachers with two years 

of Teach for America experience (as of June 30, 
2020) 

iv. FTE count of uncertified teachers with 

exceptional business, professional, artistic, 3 

athletic, or military experience (as June 30, 2020) 

Total Category B: not to exceed 5 3.0 
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CATEGORY C: PLUS 5 ADDITIONAL UNCERTIFIED TEACHERS 

FTE Count 

i. FTE count of uncertified teacher with at least 
three years of elementary, middle or secondary 

classroom teaching experience (as of June 30, 
2020) 

ii. FTE count of uncertified teachers who are 

tenured or tenure track college faculty (as of June 

30, 2020) 

iii. FTE count of uncertified teachers with two years 

of Teach for America experience (as of June 30, 
2020) 

iv. FTE count of uncertified teachers with 

exceptional business, professional, artistic, 2.5 

athletic, or military experience (as June 30, 2020) 

Total Category C: not to exceed 5 2.5 

CATEGORY D: TOTAL FTE COUNT OF UNCATEGORIZED, UNCERTIFIED TEACHERS 

(Include teachers who do not fit in one of these categories or if did fit would exceed the numerical limits for 
that category) 

FTE Count 

Total Category D 0 

CATEGORY E: TOTAL FTE COUNT OF CERTIFIED TEACHERS 

FTE Count 

Total Category E 65.5 
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CATEGORY F: TOTAL FTE COUNT OF ALL TEACHERS 

Please do not include paraprofessionals, such as teacher aides. 

FTE Count 

Total Category F 76 

Thank you. 

Entry 13 Organization Chart 
Completed Jul 21 2020 

Instructions 

Required of Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE Authorized Charter Schools ONLY 

Upload the 2019-2020 Organization Chart. The organization chart should include position titles and 
reporting relationships. Employee names should not appear on the chart. 

ICS Organization Chart May 2020 

Filename: ICS Organization Chart May 2020 BJgiX3Y.pdf Size: 90.8 kB 

Entry 14 School Calendar 

Completed Sep 15 2020 

Instructions for submitting School Calendar 

Required of ALL Charter Schools 

Given these uncertain and changing times, charter schools may or may not have a school calendar ready 
to upload by the submission deadline this year of August 3, 2020. If the charter school has a tentative 

calendar based on available information and guidance at the time, please submit with the August 3rd 

submission. Charter schools will be able to upload an updated school calendar into the portal at any time 
but no later than September 15, 2020. 

School calendars must meet the minimum instructional requirements adopted by the Board of Regents in 
2018. 

Board of Regents-authorized charter schools are required to submit school calendars that 
clearly indicate the start and end date of the instructional year AND the number of 
instructional hours and/or instructional days for each month. 

Lavelle Prep Calendar # Of Days 

Filename: Lavelle Prep Calendar Of Days.pdf Size: 423.6 kB 
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Entry 15 Links to Critical Documents on School Website 

Completed Jul 31 2020 

Instructions 

Required of Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE Authorized Charter Schools ONLY 

By law, each charter school is required to maintain certain notices and policies listed on its website. 
Please insert the link from the school’s website for each of the items: 

1. Most recently filed Annual Report (i.e., 2018-19 Annual Report); 
2. Most recent board meeting notice, documents to be discussed at the meeting (if any), and 

webcast of Board meetings (if held virtually per Governor’s Executive Order); 
3. Link to New York State School Report Card; 
4. Lottery Notice announcing date of lottery; 
5. Authorizer-approved DASA Policy; 
6. District-wide safety plan and Authorizer-approved Discipline Policy (as per August 29, 2019 

Emergency Response Plan Memo); 
7. Authorizer-approved FOIL Policy; and 
8. Subject matter list of FOIL records. 
9. Link to School Reopening Plan 

Form for Entry 15 Links to Critical Documents on
School Website 

School Name: John W. Lavelle Preparatory Charter School 
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Required of Regents, NYCDOE, and Buffalo BOE Authorized Charter Schools ONLY 

By law, each charter school is required to maintain certain notices and policies listed on its 

website. Please insert the link from the school’s website for each of the items: 

1. Most Recent Annual Report (i.e., 2018-19) 

2. Most Recent Board Meeting Notice and Related 

Agenda Item Documents 

2a. Webcast of Board Meetings (per Governor's 

Executive Order) 

3. Link to NYS School Report Card 

4. Most Recent Lottery Notice Announcing Lottery 

5. Authorizer-Approved DASA Policy 

6. District-wide Safety Plan 

6a. Authorizer-Approved Discipline Policy (as per 
August 29, 2019 Emergency Response Plan Memo) 

7. Authorizer-Approved FOIL Policy 

8. Subject matter list of FOIL records 

9. Link to School Reopening Plan 

Link to Documents 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/07/john-w-lavelle-
preparatory-charter-school.pdf 

http://integrationcharterschools.org/board-
documents/ 

http://integrationcharterschools.org/board-
documents/ 

http://lavelleprep.org/parent-resources/ 

http://lavelleprep.org/enrollment/ 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/03/LP-Student-Handbook-
2019-2020-FINAL-1.pdf 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/07/Lavelle-Prep-ICS-Plan-
SAVE-2019-2020-.docx.pdf 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/03/LP-Student-Handbook-
2019-2020-FINAL-1.pdf 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/07/FOIL-Policy-20-21-2.pdf 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/07/FOIL-ICS-Subject-Matter-
List-20-21-2.pdf 

http://lavelleprep.org/wp-
content/uploads/2020/07/The-ICS-Reopening-
Plan FINAL-1.pdf 
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Thank you. 

Entry 16 COVID 19 Related Information 

Completed Jul 23 2020 

Instructions 

Required of ALL charter schools 

Please provide the number of students attending instruction on the last day instruction was provided 
within physical school facilities and the number of students participating in virtual programming on the 
last day such programming was offered for the 2019-2020 school year. 

If applicable, please provide the name and publisher of all end of year assessments provided by grade 
level as well as the number of participating students. Board of Regents-authorized charter schools are 
encouraged to refer to Appendix B of the Remote Monitoring and Oversight Plan Spring 2020 remote for 
best practices regarding end of year assessments in a remote learning environment. 

Entry 16 COVID 19 Related Information 

School Name: John W. Lavelle Preparatory Charter School 

TABLE 1: 2019-2020 Enrollment, Attendance and 
Participation Between March-June 2020 

Please provide the number of students attending instruction on the last day instruction was provided within 

physical school facilities and the number of students participating in virtual programming on the last day 

such programming was offered for the 2019-2020 school year. 

Number of students Number of students Number of students 

enrolled in school on the attending instruction on participating in virtual 
last day instruction was the last day instruction programming on the 

provided within physical was provided within last day such 

school facilities physical school facilities programming was 

offered for the 2019-20 

school year 

720 488 647 

Table 2: 2019-2020 Assessments and Grade Participation 
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If applicable, please provide the name and publisher of all end of year assessments provided by grade 

level as well as the number of participating students. Board of Regents-authorized charter schools are 

encouraged to refer to Appendix B of the Remote Monitoring and Oversight Plan Spring 2020 remote for 
best practices regarding end of year assessments in a remote learning environment. 

Ass 

ess 

me 

nt 
Title 

ELA 

I-
Rea 

dy 

by 

Curr 
icul 
um 

Ass 

ocia 

tes 

ELA 

Mat 
h by 

Curr 
icul 
um 

Ass 

ocia 

tes 

Tea 

che 

r 
crea 

ted 

stan 

Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra Gra 

de de de de 3 de 4 de 5 de 6 de 7 de 8 de 9 de de de 

K 1 2 10 11 12 

Nu 

mbe 

r of 
Parti 
cipa 

ting 

Stud 

ents 

220 

220 

54 / 60 



	 	

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

220 

dar 
ds 

alig 

ned 

ass 

ess 

me 

nts 

for 
ELA 

Tea 

che 

r 
crea 

ted 

stan 

dar 
ds 

alig 

ned 

ass 

ess 

me 

nts 

for 
Mat 
h 

Tea 

che 

r 
crea 

ted 

stan 

dar 
ds 

alig 

ned 

cul 
min 

atin 

g 

proj 
ects 

220 

220 

55 / 60 



	 	

	

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

for 
ELA 

Tea 

che 

r 
crea 

ted 

stan 

dar 
ds 

alig 

ned 

cul 
min 

atin 

g 

proj 
ects 

for 
Mat 
h 

ELA. 
Publ 
ishe 

r i-
Rea 

dy 

Mat 
h, 
Publ 
ishe 

r 
Ima 

gine 

Mat 
h 

Na 

me: 
Engl 
ish 

Lite 

220 

238 

267 

56 / 60 



	 	

	

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

ratu 40 

re 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
US 

Hist 
ory 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Glo 

bal 
Hist 
ory 

ll 
Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Alg 

ebr 
a l 
CC 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Geo 

met 
ry 

42 

37 

59 

57 / 60 



	 	

	

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

 

34 CC 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Alg 

ebr 
a ll 
CC 

33 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Pre 

-
Calc 

ulus 

: 
Publ 
ishe 

r: 
CLE 

P 
10 

Prac 

tice 

Exa 

m 

[(c) 
CLE 

P] 
(ICS 

Edit 
ed) 

Na 

me: 
Livi 
ng 

Envi 

58 / 60 



	 	

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

  

 

 

ron 

me 

nt 
Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Eart 
h 

Scie 

nce 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

Na 

me: 
Che 

mist 
ry 

Publ 
ishe 

r: 
ICS 

56 

35 

17 

Tota 218 

59 / 60 



	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	
	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	

	 	 	 	

  

          

    

       

               
                

      

     

     

  

l 8.0 

Entry 17 Staff Roster - NEW TASK For Regents Schools Only 

Completed Aug 3 2020 

INSTRUCTIONS - NEW TASK FOR REGENTS-AUTHORIZED CHARTER SCHOOLS 

Please provide the full name of ANY and ALL instructional and non-instructional employees and their 
respective positions/titles, and employment start dates in the charter school by clicking on the MS Excel 
file link to the Staff Roster. 

LP Staff List for 19-20 

Filename: LP Staff List for 19 20.xlsx Size: 17.1 kB 
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 ���°��° �ˇ°˛�ˇ�˝�ˇ
 ���ˇ˝°ˇ ˜����� ���� ��� ���°� �ˇ 

˜°˛˝°˙ˆ°ˇ ���� �°ˆˇ��ˇ
 ��� 
Sept 1 - All Sta˜ Returns Feb 4- Half Day/ Virtual Parent-Teacher Conference 
Sept 7- Schools Closed - Labor Day Feb 5- NO STUDENTS Full Day PD 
Sept 10- First Day of School Feb 15- Schools Closed - Presidents’ Day 
Sept 18- Schools Closed - Rosh Hashanah Feb 15-19-Schools Closed-  Mid-Winter Break 
Sept 21- 9th/10th grade Virtual Parent Orientations 6:00 PM Feb 25- Open House 
Sept 22- Elementary  Virtual Parent Orientations 6:00 PM 
Sept 23- 11/12 grade Virtual Parent Orientations 6:00 PM 
Sept 24- Middle School  Virtual Parent Orientations  6:00 PM 
Sept 28- Schools Closed - Yom Kippur ��ˇ�� ��� 

Mar 3- SAT Exam (High School Students Only) 
��˝�ˆ°ˇ ���� Mar 11- Open House 
Oct 12- Schools Closed - Columbus Day] Mar 18- Open House 
Oct 14- PSAT Exam (High School  Students Only) Mar 29-31- Schools Closed- Spring Break 

���°˙ˆ°ˇ ���� 
Nov 3- No School for Students - Election Day/ Full Day PD �˛ˇ†� ��� 
Nov 11- Schools Closed - Veterans Day Apr 1-2- Schools Closed - Spring Break 
Nov 13- 1st Marking Period Ends Apr 9- NO STUDENTS Full Day PD 
Nov 19- Half Day/ Virtual Parent-Teacher Conference Apr 14- Elementary Lottery 4:30 PM 
Nov 26- Schools Closed - Thanksgiving Day Apr 19- Middle School Lottery 4:30 PM 
Nov 27- Schools Closed Apr 20-22- ELA State Exams 

Apr 23- 3rd Marking Period Ends 
Apr 29- Half Day/ Virtual Parent-Teacher Conference 

�°�°˙ˆ°ˇ ���� 
Dec 25- Schools Closed - Christmas Day 
Dec 24-31- Schools Closed -Winter Recess ��
 ��� 

May 4-6- Math State Exams 
May 13- School Closed - Eid al Fitr 
May 31- Schools Closed - Memorial Day 

�����ˇ
 ��� 
Jan 1- Schools Closed - New Year’s Day 
Jan 18- Schools Closed - M.L King Day ���° ��� 
Jan 26-29- Regents June 2- Regents US History & Government 
Jan 29- 2nd Marking Period Ends June 3-  NO STUDENTS Full Day PD 

June 7- Science State Exams (Grades 4 & 8) 
June 15 - 17- Regents Exams 
June 21 - 24-  Regents Exams 
June 25- 4th Marking Period Ends 
June 25- Last Day of School 

181 Days Total *Dates highlighted in orange apply to all ICS students and employees 
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